
 

          
       

          
          

         
            

           
          

        
          

       
         

        
          

         
         

             
        

            
          

 

        
          

      
       

         
       

    
   

       

       
    

   

          
        

          
              

       
            

           
          
          

       

Louis A. Martarano oversees the Science BS/MBA Program. After graduating from 
Penn State, Lou worked as a Manufacturing Chemist for W.R Grace in Lexington, 
Massachusetts. He then attended the Yale School of  Management (Master of  Public 
and Private Management). Afterwards, he started his financial services career at Kidder 
Peabody & Co. as a specialist in the energy, environmental and infrastructure industries 
for 11 years. Then, at Merrill Lynch Lou was responsible for a leading role in its project 
finance business, eventually establishing and managing its London Project Finance 
Group. He counseled a wide range of  domestic and international clients in their efforts 
to raise funds for large-scale energy, environmental and infrastructure facilities, raising 
several billion dollars through public and private offerings of  equity and debt (high 
grade and high yield), joint ventures, mergers and acquisitions, and advisory 
assignments.

Lou currently assists businesses and entrepreneurial ventures in organizational 
assessment, executive coaching and management best practices. He also is the co-
founder of  Argent Protects, which uses nano-silver technology and an eCommerce 
platform developed at Penn State to provide high quality antimicrobial products that 
have built-in natural protection against bacteria and fungus.

Lou has substantial educational, governance and advisory experience. He serves as 
Chair of  the Eberly College of  Science Dean's Advisory Board and also on the College’s 
Development Committee. He also chairs the Advisory Board of  Penn State's Palmer Art 
Museum. He is a board member for the Yale Alumni Non-Profit Alliance and has 
established their Roundtable program on best practices and was instrumental in the 
development of  the strategic plan. He has also served on the Board of  Trustees for 
Marymount Manhattan College, which he also chaired.


